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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

R1-1 Stop 30” x 30” $44.60 $36.53 $52.56 NO BID
R1-1 Stop - Holes 26" O.C. 36” x 36” $60.60 $52.61 $75.68 NO BID
R1-2 Yield 36” x 36” $31.40 $26.30 $41.70 NO BID
R1-3P All Way 18” x 6” $5.20 $6.37 $8.80 NO BID
R15-1 Railroad Cross Buck (Extrusion Type) 48” x 9” $57.60 $106.20 $27.22 NO BID

9” x 9” $3.98 $28.33 $12.32 NO BID
27” x 9” $11.65 $34.86 $16.85 NO BID

Reflector Strip (White) 3” x 48” $6.89 $9.44 $12.32 NO BID
Except Right Turn (White-Message & Border 
with Red Face

18” x 18” $15.51 $13.15 $22.45 NO BID

R2-1 Speed Limit (All Speeds) 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $46.02 NO BID
R4-1 Do Not Pass 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $46.02 NO BID
R4-2 Pass With Care 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $46.02 NO BID
R4-7 Keep Right (Symbol) 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $46.02 NO BID
R5-1 Do Not Enter 30” x 30” $45.07 $36.53 $52.56 NO BID
R6-1 One Way (Right & Left) 36” x 12” $20.67 $17.54 $27.61 NO BID
R7-1 No Parking Any Time 18” x 24” $20.67 $17.54 $27.61 NO BID
R7-8 Handicap Parking 12” x 18” $10.34 $11.69 $13.81 NO BID
R7-14 No Stopping Standing Parking 18” x 24” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
R7-201P Tow-Away Zone 12” x 6” $3.60 $5.38 $6.16 NO BID
R11-2 Road Closed 48” x 30” $68.90 $58.45 $82.76 NO BID
R11-3A Road Closed ___ Miles Ahead Local Traffic Only  60” x 30” $86.13 $73.07 $116.51 NO BID
S5-2 End School Zone 24" x 30" $34.45 $29.23 $49.91 NO BID
S4-1P Time Plaque - 7:00 am - 8:00 am / 3:00 pm - 4:00 

pm
24" x 10" $11.51 $15.96 $49.91 NO BID

S4-3P School 24" x 8" $9.24 $13.40 $15.49 NO BID
S4-6P Mon - Fri 24" x 10" $11.51 $15.96 $16.64 NO BID

R15-2 2 Tracks

Lenawee County Road Commission
Signs, Sign Blanks and Sign Posts



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD
OM-3 (R & L) Object Marker Type 3 (Right & Left) 12” x 36” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
S1-1 School Advance 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $99.99 NO BID
S2-1 School Crossing 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $99.99 NO BID
W3-5A Speed Reduction All Speeds 30" x 30" $48.07 $40.02 $59.18 NO BID

Not In Manual All the following to have Black Legend 
and Border on Yellow Face:
Fire Station (Word Panel) 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
Blind Child Area 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Deaf Child Area 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Low Flying Aircraft 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Narrow Shoulder 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Water Over Road 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Water Over Road 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $85.22 NO BID
Blank Yellow/Black Border 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
Blank Yellow/Black Border 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $59.18 NO BID

W3-1
Stop Ahead 30” x 30”

$48.07 $40.02 $59.18 NO BID
W3-1 Stop Ahead - holes 30" O.C. 36” x 36”

$67.00 $58.02 $59.18 NO BID
W3-2 Yield Ahead 30” x 30”

$48.07 $40.02 $59.18 NO BID
W3-3 Signal Ahead - holes 30" O.C. 36” x 36”

$67.00 $58.02 $59.18 NO BID
W3-5 Speed Red. All Speeds 30" x 30"

$48.07 $40.02 $59.18 NO BID



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

R11-3B Bridge Out ___ Miles Ahead Local Traffic Only 60" x 30" $86.13 $73.07 $116.51 NO BID
R11-4 Road Closed to Thru Traffic 60” x 30” $86.13 $73.07 $116.51 NO BID
R12-1 Weight Limit __ Tons 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $49.91 NO BID
R12-8 Seasonal Load and Speed Restrictions 

In Effect
24” x 30”

$34.45 $29.23 $49.91 NO BID
R5-18 Traffic Fines Doubled In Work Zones MDOT std $82.68 $102.30 $186.43 NO BID
R5-18B Injure/Kill A Worker $7500 

+ 15 years
MDOT std

$137.80 $102.30 $186.43 NO BID
R1-1a Paddle sign with adjustable handle MDOT std $105.00 $80.15 NO BID NO BID

Not In Manual All the following to have Black Legend 
and Border on White Face:
On Bridge Ahead 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
Keep Right (Word Panel) 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
No Thru Trucks 24” x 30” $34.45 $29.23 $49.91 NO BID
No Dumping 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
No Trespassing 18” x 12” $10.34 $10.77 $14.98 NO BID
Silver Reflector 4" x 8" $2.10 $5.61 $12.32 NO BID

All Standard Warning 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.18 NO BID
All Standard Warning 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $85.22 NO BID

W1-6 Target Arrow - holes 32" O.C. 48” x 24” $55.12 $46.76 $66.20 NO BID
W1-7 Bi-Arrow  - holes 32" O.C. 48” x 24” $55.12 $46.76 $66.20 NO BID
W1-8 Chevron 18” x 24” $20.67 $17.54 $27.61 NO BID
W10-1 Railroad Advance 36” $62.01 $52.61 $76.26 NO BID
W13-1 Advisory Speed (All Speeds) 18” x 18” $15.51 $13.15 $20.72 NO BID
W4-4AP Traffic From Left (Right) Does Not Stop 24” x 12” $13.78 $11.69 $19.95 NO BID
W4-4P Cross Traffic Does Not Stop 36” x 18” 31.01 $26.30 $45.58 NO BID



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

All Standard Construction 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $85.75 NO BID
All Standard Construction 48” x 48” $110.24 $93.53 $150.10 NO BID

G20-1 Road Work Next __ Miles 60” x 24” $68.90 $58.45 $93.81 NO BID
G20-2 End Road Work 48” x 24” $55.12 $46.76 $84.88 NO BID
R5-18C Work Zone Begins 48” x 48” $110.24 $93.53 $150.10 NO BID
M4-10 Detour Arrow 

(R & L) (Right & Left)

M4-9 Detour (All Directions) 30” x 24” $34.45 $29.23 $50.20 NO BID
M4-8A Detour Ends 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $30.13 NO BID

Blank Orange/Black Border 30” x 30” $43.07 $36.53 $59.56 NO BID
Blank Orange/Black Border 36” x 12” $20.67 $17.54 $30.13 NO BID
Blank Orange/Black Border 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $85.75 NO BID
Blank Orange/Black Border 48” x 48” $110.24 $93.53 $150.10 NO BID

Stacker Stand Base Unit $220.00 $130.25 $262.43 NO BID
36” Vinyl Signs/Cross Ribs (Standard Legends) 36” x 36” $46.27 $50.08 $185.94 NO BID

ER-1B End of Road Marker 18” x 18” $15.51 $13.15 $22.45 NO BID
I2-2 Enter Lenawee County 24” x 18” $20.67 $21.50 $29.94 NO BID
 Not in 
Manual

Enter Raisin Charter Township (White Legend and 
Border on Green Face)

30” x 24”
$34.45 $35.84 $49.91 NO BID

Not In 
Manual

Welcome to Tecumseh Township (White Legend and 
Border on Green Face)

30” x 18”
$25.84 $26.88 $37.42 NO BID

Natural Beauty Road w/symbol 24” x 30” $34.45 $47.07 $49.91 NO BID
Natural Beauty Road  Next __ Miles (Green Legend 
and Border on White Face)

24” x 18”
$20.67 $21.50 $29.94 NO BID

 Not in 
Manual

Enter Adrian Charter Township (White Legend and 
Border on Green Face)

30” x 24” $34.45 $35.84 $49.91 NO BID

NO BID48” x 18” $41.34 $35.07 $60.24



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

Not in 
Manual

Loose Stone - Orange 36” x 36” $62.01 $52.61 $85.75 NO BID

R12-5 Weight Limit 24" x 36" $41.34 $35.07 $59.89 NO BID

HIP Reflector Strip (Red) 3" x 72' $10.34 $12.16 $14.98 NO BID

HIP Reflector Strip (Yellow) 3" x 72' $10.34 $12.16 $14.98 NO BID

W4-4P Cross Traffic Does Not Stop 24" x 12" $13.78 $11.69 $19.95 NO BID

Traffic Barrels w/ Tire Ring 42" $68.70 $81.21 $41.71 NO BID

Adopt-A-Road 24” x 24” $27.56 $31.12 $39.92 NO BID
Blank Blue Border on White Face 24” x 18” $20.67 $17.54 $29.94 NO BID
Finished Road Name  (Green w/ White Letters Both 
Sides)

24” x 9” $12.66 $32.55 $21.75 NO BID
Finished Road Name  (Green w/ White Letters Both 
Sides)

30” x 9” $15.83 $37.75 $27.19 NO BID
Finished Road Name  (Green w/ White Letters Both 
Sides)

36” x 9” $18.99 $42.85 $40.58 NO BID
Finished Road Name  (Green w/ White Letters Both 
Sides)

42” x 9” $22.16 $48.00 $47.34 NO BID
Blank Aluminum 12” x 6” $2.35 $3.85 $2.93 NO BID
Blank Aluminum 18” x 18” $10.58 $9.67 $12.01 NO BID
Blank Aluminum 24” x 30” $23.50 $21.49 $26.70 NO BID

Orange Pl. Fence 4’ x 50’ Rolls (1 1/2” Diamonds)
$47.80 $90.93 NO BID NO BID

12 Volt Flasher Lights (meeting current MDOT 
Standards

L.E.D.
$17.90 $23.17 NO BID NO BID

Solar Flasher Lights (meeting current MDOT Standards L.E.D.
$26.80 $45.91 NO BID NO BID

6 Volt Batteries
$3.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sign Backing Plates
$1.30 $0.85 NO BID NO BID

Wooden Post MDOT Breakaway Sleeve for 4" x 6" Post
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

Type III Barricade Complete (meeting current MDOT 
and Federal Safety Standards).  To be 8" wide x 8' 
length x 5' height with High Intensity or Equal 
Reflective Stripes; front side to be 6" right stripes and 
back side to be 6" left stripes.  

Plastic
$295.00 $397.83 $421.32 NO BID

Type III Barricade Panels 8" x 8' High Intensity or 
Equal Pre-stripped for total closure; Stripes are 
positioned to slope downward toward center of 
barricade

Plastic $310.00 $88.28 $52.49 NO BID

Type III Barricade Panels 8" x 8' High Intensity or 
Equal Pre-stripped; front side to be 6" right stripes 
and back side to be 6" left stripes.

Plastic $295.00 $88.28 $52.49 NO BID

3” Round Clear or White (with nuts and bolts $1.30 $4.32 NO BID
5/16” Break Away Nut - High Torque $0.85 $0.87 NO BID $0.70
5/16 x 2 1/2" Truss-Head Bolts $0.85 $0.54 NO BID NO BID
Delineator Post 7 ft. $8.40 $8.59 $10.91 $11.00
Navicade 46 Cone (4) 6" HIP Strips O/W/OW $28.00 $28.46 $19.98 NO BID
Navicade 16 Rubber Base $22.00 $17.69 $11.56 NO BID
3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Green Baked Enamel Holes 
to be 1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

7 ft.
$21.91 $19.25 $20.89 $17.99

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Green Baked Enamel Holes 
to be 1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

11 ft.
$34.43 $30.25 $32.82 $28.27

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Green Baked Enamel Holes 
to be 1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

12 ft.
$37.56 $33.00 $35.80 $30.84

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Green Baked Enamel Holes 
to be 1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

13 ft.
$40.69 $35.75 $41.77 $33.41

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Green Baked Enamel Holes 
to be 1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

14 ft.
$43.82 $38.50 $44.01 $35.98

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia.

7 ft.
$32.90 $25.10 $26.57 $23.87

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia.

11 ft.
$51.70 $39.45 $41.75 $37.51

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia.

12 ft.
$56.40 $43.03 $45.54 $40.92

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia.

13 ft. $61.10 $46.62 $49.34 $44.33



ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION SIZE Lightle Dornbos Eberl MD

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 
1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

14 ft.
$65.80 $50.20 $56.38 $47.74

3 lb./ft. U-Channel Post Galvanized  Holes to be 
1” apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in 

16 ft.
$75.20 $57.38 $64.43 $54.56

Uni-Strut - 1 1/4" square x 2' long Holes to be 1" 
apart full length of post. Holes to be 5/16" in dia. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Uni-Strut - 1 1/4" square x 3' long Holes to be 1" 
apart full length of post. Holes to be 5/16" in dia. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Uni-Strut - 1 3/4" square x 5' long Holes to be 1" 
apart full length of post. Holes to be 3/8" in dia. $16.80 NO BID $18.98 $26.00
Uni-Strut 1 3/4" square x 8' long Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia. $26.88 NO BID $29.50 $41.00
Uni-Strut 1 3/4" square x 10' long Holes to be 1” 
apart full length of post.  Holes to be 3/8” in dia. $33.60 NO BID $36.88 $52.00

HIP or Equal White 18” x 50 
Yards $294.75 $289.58 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal Yellow 18” x 50 
Yards $299.75 $289.58 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal Red 18” x 50 
Yards $294.75 $289.58 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal Green 18” x 50 
Yards $294.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal Orange 6” x 50 
Yards $98.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 2" White Series D Letters & Numbers
$6.08 $6.79 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 4" White Series D Letters & Numbers
$9.27 $9.67 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 6" White Series D Letters & Numbers
$11.07 $12.83 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 2" Black Series D Letters & Numbers
$6.08 $5.96 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 4" Black Series D Letters & Numbers
$9.27 $8.62 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 5" Black Series D Letters & Numbers
$10.80 $10.47 NO BID NO BID

HIP or Equal 6" Black Series D Letters & Numbers
$11.07 $11.72 NO BID NO BID



Bid Firm Date Terms Comments

Lightle 12/31/2026 Net 30

Dornbos 01/01/2027 Net 30

Eberl Iron Works 01/01/2027 .5, 11 Net 30

MD Solutions 1 Year  Net 30

Lenawee County Road Commission Sign Bid Results


