Lenawee County Road Commission

Pavement Marking

2026 M&M P.K.

Size Quantities Unit Unit Price Total Unit Unit Price Total Unit Unit Price Total
Waterborne, 4 inch Yellow 2,250,000 FT $0.080 $180,000.00 FT $0.066 $148,500.00 FT
Waterborne, 4 inch White 310,000 FT $0.090 $27,900.00 FT $0.064 $19,840.00 FT
Rumble Strips "Raised" 80 FT $30.00 $2,400.00 FT $8.50 $680.00 FT
Waterborne, Railroad Symbol 36 EA $290.00 $10,440.00 EA $110.00 $3,960.00 EA
Waterborne, 24" Stop Bar 1080 FT $4.00 $4,320.00 FT $2.00 $2,160.00 FT
Waterborne, Rt Turn Arrow 2 EA $90.00 $180.00 EA NO BID $0.00 EA
Waterborne, Lt Turn Arrow 6 EA $90.00 $540.00 EA NO BID $0.00 EA
Waterborne, Thru/Rt Turn Arrow 6 EA $160.00 $960.00 EA NO BID $0.00 EA
Waterborne, "Only" 6 EA $120.00 $720.00 EA NO BID $0.00 EA
Waterborne, "School" 8 EA $180.00 $1,440.00 EA NO BID $0.00 EA
Waterborne, 6 inch Crosswalk 84 FT $3.90 $327.60 FT NO BID $0.00 FT
Cold Plactic 12" Crosswalk 176 FT $15.00 $2,640.00 FT $7.00 $1,232.00 EA
Cold Plactice, 6" Tape 160 FT $12.00 $1,920.00 FT $160.00 $1,120.00 EA
6" 3M 270 Tape w/ Glue 160 FT $12.00 $1,920.00 FT $4.00 $6.40 FT

Total $235,707.60 $177,012.00

Bid Due - 1-08-26 1:30 pm

Add $500.00 for Mob on Rumble Strips




