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Size Unit Price Unit Band Price Unit Price Unit Band Price Unit Price Unit
Band 
Price

Unit Price Unit
Band 
Price

Unit Price Unit
Band 
Price

12" Culv Pipe (16 Gage) $8.13 / FT $12.60 $8.20 / FT $12.30 NO BID / FT $8.24 / FT $12.36 / FT

15" Culv Pipe (16 Gage) $9.78 / FT $15.16 $9.84 / FT $14.76 NO BID / FT $10.30 / FT $15.45 / FT

18" Culv Pipe (16 Gage) $12.25 / FT $18.38 $12.30 / FT $18.45 NO BID / FT $12.35 / FT $18.53 / FT

24" Culv Pipe (14 Gage) $20.59 / FT $41.18 $20.40 / FT $40.80 NO BID / FT $19.50 / FT $43.88 / FT

30" Culv Pipe (14 Gage) $25.70 / FT $51.40 $25.50 / FT $51.00 NO BID / FT $26.30 / FT $59.18 / FT

36" Culv Pipe (12 Gage) $41.88 / FT $83.76 $41.40 / FT $82.80 NO BID / FT $41.92 / FT $94.32 / FT

42" Culv Pipe (12 Gage) $48.79 / FT $97.58 $48.17 / FT $96.34 NO BID / FT $48.55 / FT $109.24 / FT

48" Culv Pipe (12 Gage) $55.79 / FT $111.58 $55.25 / FT $110.50 NO BID / FT $55.85 / FT $125.66 / FT

54" Culv Pipe (10 Gage) $80.88 / FT $161.76 $79.58 / FT $159.16 NO BID / FT $80.35 / FT $180.79 / FT

60" Culv Pipe (10 Gage) $110.20 / FT $220.40 $106.20 / FT $212.40 NO BID / FT $116.90 / FT $263.03 / FT

Discount

Net

Comments

1-08-26 2:45 p.m.

Prices firm for 60 days. Prices 
include full truck delivery to your 

yard or jobsite, as needed.  For less 
than truck load quantities, freight 

charges apply

1% - 10 Days

30

1% - 10 Days

30

1% - 10 Days

Prices good until April 1st.No 
delivery charge or minimum

Lenawee County Road Commission

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, & DUAL WALL PLATIC 

Cadillac CulvertJensen Bridge St. Regis

Prices firm for 30 days from bid 
date.  Min Load to include freight is 

$7,500 4-6 weeks / ARO

Advanced Drainage

30
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Size Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit
Band 
Price

Unit Price Unit

4" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $2.50 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

6" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $2.75 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

8" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $3.77 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

10" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $5.33 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

12" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $5.87 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

15" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $8.24 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

18" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $11.75 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

24" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $20.16 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

30" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $26.80 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

36" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $35.39 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

42" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $45.53 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

48" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $59.01 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

60" N-12 Dual Wall Pipe NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $95.42 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

Discount

Net

Comments

1-08-26 2:45 p.m.

Lenawee County Road Commission

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, & DUAL WALL PLATIC 

Jensen Bridge St. Regis Advanced Drainage Cadillac Culvert
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Size Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit

12" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $9.56 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

15" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $13.49 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

18" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $18.75 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

24" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $29.93 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

30" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $39.99 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

36" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $52.85 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

42" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $65.25 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

48" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $88.89 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

60" HP Storm Dual Wall NO BID / FT NO BID / FT $119.52 / FT NO BID / FT / FT

Discount

Net

Comments

1-08-26 2:45 p.m.

-

-

Lenawee County Road Commission

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE, & DUAL WALL PLATIC 

Jensen Bridge St. Regis Advanced Drainage Cadillac Culvert


