Bid Due 1-08-26

Lenawee County Road Commission

2:15PM Crushed Limestone

2026 Stone Co. Heidelberg Materials
O.D.O.T.#1,2 $14.00 $16.00
1"x 3" $14.00 No Bid
O.D.O.T. #4's $19.55 $15.85
O.D.O.T.#6'sor 17A $22.65 $18.65
M.D.O.T. 29A $15.45 No Bid
M.D.O.T. 34 CS $39.00 No Bid
0.D.O.T. Washed # 9's $17.00 $15.65
0.D.0.T#411 $10.45 $10.50
M.D.O.T. 23A $10.45 No Bid
0.D.O.T# 304 $10.45 $10.50
M.D.O.T. 21 AA $10.45 No Bid
0.D.O.T. Rip Rap Type
A,B,orC $67.00 $32.00
Rip Rap Special $67.00 No Bid
Rip Rap Heavy $57.00 No Bid
Rip Rap Plain $52.00 No Bid
Rip Rap 4"x8" $25.50 No Bid
0.D.O.T. Rip Rap
Type D $25.50 $29.50
M.D.O.T. Manufactured
Sand $9.00 No Bid
Pit or Plant Location Ottawa Lake Sylvania, OH
Price Firm Thru 12/31/2026 12/31/2026
Terms Net 30 Days Net 30 Days




