
 

30 Days Before: 
Pray for God to prepare our hearts for service; and in our 
weakness let His strength be made clear for His glory.

2 Corinthians 12:9-10


29 Days Before: 
Pray that the team would be prepared physically, emotionally and 
spiritually for the work ahead.

Ephesians 3:14-21


28 Days Before: 
Pray against any spiritual warfare coming against team members 
or the work that God has for us.

Ephesians 6:10-18


27 Days Before: 
Pray that we keep our eyes off of ourselves and on Jesus; off of 
earthly comforts and treasures and on storing up heavenly 
treasures instead.

Matthew 6:19-21


This 30 Day Prayer Guide is designed to help 
your team pray together as they prepare to 

serve on the Island through HMM.



26 Days Before: 
Pray that we show Christ’s love clearly to the people we serve.

1 Corinthians 13


25 Days Before: 
Pray that we show love, patience, and forgiveness among our 
group members.

Colossians 3:12-14


24 Days Before: 
Pray that the Lord uses our trip to bring many people to 
salvation.

Matthew 28:16-20


23 Days Before: 
Pray for team bonding and cohesiveness, that we will be an 
effective team, and that we have true Christ-like love for one 
another and for the people we are serving.

Philippians 2:5-11


22 Days Before: 
Pray for all of the funding to be raised for the trip.

Matthew 6:33


21 Days Before: 
Pray for good health for all team members and their families.

Isaiah 40:28-31




20 Days Before: 
Pray that we would follow Christ's example of servanthood.

John 13:1-15


19 Days Before: 
Pray that we place others interests before our own and that we 
value everyone’s talents as gifts from God for the good of the 
Body.

Romans 12:3-8


18 Days Before: 
Pray for the local HMM staff as they prepare for the teams and 
continue the work after we leave.

Romans 6:18


17 Days Before: 
Pray that the eyes of our hearts are open to each life placed in 
our path.

John 4:3-36


16 Days Before: 
Pray that our team respects the cultural differences and guard 
our mouths from offending those we have come to serve.

Psalm 141:3


15 Days Before: 
Pray that our faith grows as we are part of something bigger than 
ourselves.

Hebrews 11:6.8




14 Days Before: 
Pray for the translators we work with that they are able to convey 
Christ’s message clearly.

Colossians 4:2-6


13 Days Before: 
Pray that God will use this time to strengthen our families and 
grow us closer together through Him.

Proverbs 22:6


12 Days Before: 
Pray for willingness to be flexible with whatever changes in 
schedule or challenges come our way.

Proverbs 3:5-6


11 Days Before: 
Pray that we will choose thankfulness instead of complaining no 
matter the circumstances.

Psalm 100


10 Days Before: 
Pray for compassion for the people we serve.

Jonah 4:5-11


9 Days Before: 
Pray that we will measure our success by heavenly standards.

Matthew 20:20-28




8 Days Before: 
Pray that our relationship with God would be refreshed and 
renewed both now and during our time we serve.

Psalm 42:1


7 Days Before: 
Pray that language not be a barrier to our message.

Romans 15:18-21


6 Days Before: 
Pray that we do not fear.

2 Timothy 1:7


5 Days Before: 
Pray for the Holy Spirit to fill our team.

Ephesians 5:15-21


4 Days Before: 
Pray that our team will be confident in the God we serve and that 
He can and will do a great work through us.

John 6:1-14: Mark 10:27


3 Days Before: 
Pray that we represent Christ well as His ambassadors.

2 Corinthians 5:20




2 Days Before: 
Pray that God will help each family work through the final 
packing and departing details and pray they get rest!!


1 Day Before: 
Pray for traveling mercies for the team as we depart to serve and 
throughout the trip.

Proverbs 2:8


