
Bid Tabulation Village of Ottawa Bockrath & Associates
Tawa Drive Extension Engineering and Surveying, LLC

ODO

T 

Item 

Item Description - S. Hickory St. - Proposal A
Quant

ity
Unit

Total Unit 

Cost
Subtotal

Total Unit 

Cost
Subtotal

Total Unit 

Cost
Subtotal

Total Unit 

Cost
Subtotal

1 201 Clearing & Grubbing 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 203
Roadway Grading - Fine Grading Existing Stone Base to Grade (St. 

6+00 to Sta. 13+00)
2,470 SY $1.94 $4,791.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 203 12" Excavation - Roadway & Road Swales 2,980 CY $9.88 $29,442.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 203 Embankment - Earth Fill 15 CY $8.70 $130.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 204 Subgrade Compaction 3,250 SY $0.60 $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 204 Proof Rolling 4 HRS $83.90 $335.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 254 Pavement Removed including Saw Cut (Contingency) 20 SY $3.73 $74.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 301 4" Asphalt Base, PG 64-22 668 CY $195.93 $130,881.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9304 Spec.12" Aggregate Base - Recycled Concrete Base 1,420 CY $33.58 $47,683.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 304 4" Aggregate Base 350 CY $51.94 $18,179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 407 Tack Coat (0.075 GAL/SY) 451 GAL $2.27 $1,023.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 407 Tack Coat for Intermediate Course (0.04 GAL/SY) 482 GAL $2.27 $1,094.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 411
Stone Base Leveling of Existing Road (St. 6+00 to Sta. 13+00) - 

Contingency
208 CY $37.64 $7,829.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 411 8" Aggregate Berm (2 ft. wide) 60 CY $85.20 $5,112.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 441 2-1/2" Asphalt Conc. Inter., Type 2, (449) PG 64-22 418 CY $209.52 $87,579.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 441 1-1/2" Asphalt Conc. Surface, Type 1, (449) PG 64-22 251 CY $249.16 $62,539.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 605 4" Storm Sewer Underdrain w/Sock 1,216 LF $10.06 $12,232.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 611 Connect to Existing Storm Sewer Catch Basin 1 EA $1,523.05 $1,523.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 611 12" HDPE  - 22.5 Deg Bend 1 EA $76.87 $76.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 611
Catch Basin 2-2B, w/Jordon Frame #5110, Type M3 Casting & 

Grate
7 EA $1,867.80 $13,074.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 611 8" HDPE N-12 Storm Sewer, under Pavement 109 LF $36.23 $3,949.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 611 12" HDPE N-12 Storm Sewer, Not under Pavement 458 LF $30.51 $13,973.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 611 12" HDPE N-12 Storm Sewer, Under Pavement 150 LF $45.70 $6,855.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 611 10" HDPE N-12 Storm Sewer, Under Pavement 228 LF $43.98 $10,027.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 611 10" PVC SDR 35 Gravity Sanitary Sewer (Earth Backfill) 785 LF $46.61 $36,588.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 611 10" PVC SDR 35 Gravity Sanitary Sewer (Aggregate Backfill) 50 LF $126.85 $6,342.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 611 6" PVC SDR 35 Gravity Sanitary Sewer (Earth Backfill) 104 LF $42.38 $4,407.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 611 6" PVC SDR 35 Gravity Sanitary Sewer (Aggregate Backfill) 76 LF $74.52 $5,663.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 611 Sanitary Sewer Manhole 3 EA $5,280.05 $15,840.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 611 10"x 10"x 6" PVC Sewer Wye for lateral 2 EA $484.40 $968.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 611 6" Sch 40 PVC Sewer Pipe Cleanout Assembly 2 EA $367.80 $735.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 611 Connect to Existing Sanitary Sewer MH 1 EA $4,041.89 $4,041.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 624 Mobilization 1 LS $3,397.60 $3,397.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 638
Connect to Existing Water Main (Convert Watch Valve to Inline 

Valve)
1 EA $1,088.51 $1,088.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 638 6" Fire Hydrant Assembly & 6" C909 PVC Incl. Valve to Hyd. 1 EA $9,027.21 $9,027.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 638 8"x6" Tee and 6" Gate Valve 1 EA $3,174 $3,173.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 638
Re-use Ex. Fire Hydrant at end of waterline & new 8x6 Reducing 

Coupler
1 EA $1,760 $1,760.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 638 8" Waterline PVC - C909, Not under pavement 360 LF $43.78 $15,760.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 638 8" Waterline PVC - C909 under pavement 200 LF $61.26 $12,252.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 638 8" Water Watch Valve Box & Assembly 1 EA $3,023.09 $3,023.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 659 Seeding & Mulching 1 LS $4,925.06 $4,925.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 832 Erosion Control (Inlet Projection Dandy Bags) 1 LS $57.13 $57.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 Spec Testing Allowance 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 Spec MIRAFI 500X or approved equal 28,650 SF $0.15 $4,297.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Total:

Bidding Contractor --->

603,712.64$                   

Hohenbrink Exc. Ward Constr. Fenson Contracting Ohio Excavating

No Bid No Bid No Bid


