Bid Tabulation Village of Leipsic Bockrath &

2025 Street Improvements P A ...... .
OPWC Round 39 A one: 4106250708 o 40878
Contractor -> Ward Construction Helms & Sons Paul H. Bergman
:Zf_ ItNe: Base Bid - Grove, Matl;:\;rsi’t):ifnhh Streets Item Qtixt:;\lnt Unit Tot;l,sL:nit Subtotal Tot;l)sL:nit Subtotal Toté)cl)sL:nit Subtotal
1 251 [Partial Depth Pavement Repair 44 sy | $ 60.00 | $ 2,640.00 No Bid No Bid
) 254 Ez;etz:lretr;tszﬁg:isr;g)— Full Width on Grove St. and 7th St. from 2140 | sv | ¢ 300 | $ 6,447.00 No Bid No Bid
3 254 JPavement Planning (Butt Joints - 6' wide) 6 CY | $ 500.00($ 3,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4 407 [Tack Coat (0.075 GAL/SY) 160 | GAL| S 300 $ 480.00 No Bid No Bid
5 407 [Tack Coat for Intermediate Course (0.05 GAL/SY) 128 | GAL| $ 3.00( $ 384.00 No Bid No Bid
6 411 |2" Stabilized Crushed Aggregate 18" Wide 37 CY | $ 120.00 | $ 4,440.00 No Bid No Bid
- 441 ;.20" Asphalt Conc. Inter. (Leveling) Course, Type 1,(449) PG 64- 106 ov | s 28000 ¢ 29,680.00 No Bid No Bid
8 441 ]1.0" Asphalt Conc. Surface, Type 1, (448) PG 64-22 106 CcY | S 280.00 | $ 29,680.00 No Bid No Bid
9 | SPEC |Manhole Adjustment to Grade (Mr. Manhole System) 3 EA | $ 1,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 No Bid No Bid
10 | 614 |Maintaining Traffic 1 LS | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
11 | 624 ]Mobilization 1 LS |$ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Base Bid Total: $ 83,251.00 | $ - $ -
Contractor -> Ward Construction Helms & Sons Paul H. Bergman
Ref| Item Alternate #1 - Grove St. to Dead End, North & 2nd Quant .| Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit
No.| No. Streets Item Description ity Unit Cost Subtotal Cost Subtotal Cost Subtotal
1 251 |Partial Depth Pavement Repair 30 sy 1S 60.00 | $ 1,800.00 No Bid No Bid
2 254 JPavement Planning (Butt Joints & Drives) 235 sy | $ 10.00 | $ 2,350.00 No Bid No Bid
3 407 |Tack Coat (0.075 GAL/SY) 80 GAL] S 3.00($ 240.00 No Bid No Bid
4 407 [Tack Coat for Intermediate Course (0.05 GAL/SY) 55 GAL| $ 3.00| S 165.00 No Bid No Bid
5 411 |2" Stabilized Crushed Aggregate 18" Wide 26 cY | S 120.00 | $ 3,120.00 No Bid No Bid
6 441 ;.20" Asphalt Conc. Inter. (Leveling) Course, Type 1,(449) PG 64- 50 o | s 280.00 | $ 14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
7 441 ]1.0" Asphalt Conc. Surface, Type 1, (448) PG 64-22 50 CY | $ 280.00 [ $ 14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
8 614 [Maintaining Traffic 1 IS |$ 50000|S$ 500.00 No Bid No Bid
9 624 |Mobilization 1 LS |$ 500.00|$ 500.00 No Bid No Bid
Alternate #1 Bid Total: $ 36,675.00 | $ - S -
Contractor -> Ward Construction Helms & Sons Paul H. Bergman
Ret] Item Quan Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit
No.| No. Alternate #2 - Patti Lane - Item Description tity Unit Cost Subtotal Cost Subtotal Cost Subtotal
1] 251 rni\;?sr:ei:ltoilsaanI;r;gXEAh;Tﬁh:;t Butt Joints - 6" wide at Drives, 50 | sy |$  1000]¢ 50000 No Bid No Bid
2 254 [Pavement Planning at Concrete Drives 17 sy 1S 250.00 [ $ 4,250.00 No Bid No Bid
3 254 |Partial Depth Pavement Repair 67 sY | S 60.00 [ $ 4,020.00 No Bid No Bid
4 407 |Tack Coat (0.075 GAL/SY) 186 | GAL] S 3.00($ 558.00 No Bid No Bid
5 407 [Tack Coat for Intermediate Course (0.05 GAL/SY) 124 | GAL] S 3.00($ 372.00 No Bid No Bid
6 441 ]1.0" Asphalt Conc. Inter. Course, Type 1,(448) PG 64-22 115 cY | S 280.00 | $ 32,200.00 No Bid No Bid
7 441 ]1.0" Asphalt Conc. Surface, Type 1, (448) PG 64-22 115 CY | $ 280.00 | $ 32,200.00 No Bid No Bid
8 | SPEC |Manhole Adjustment to Grade (Mr. Manhole System) 1 EA | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 No Bid No Bid
9 614 [Maintaining Traffic 1 LS |$ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
10 624 |Mobilization 1 LS | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Alternate #2 Bid Total: $ 77,600.00 | $ - $ -
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