

EXHIBIT D

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-11-18	Settlement	Revise and finalize Dec of AYD ISO class settlement and fees/costs (2:00); Edit and finalize motion for preliminary approval of class settlement (1:24); Edit and finalize motion for fees/costs (1:36)	Aashish Desai	1250	5.00	\$6,250
2025-10-12	Pleadings	Review revise Plaintiffs' motion for attorney's fee and service awards	Aashish Desai	1250	4.70	\$5,875
2025-10-11	Pleadings	Review, revise Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary approval	Aashish Desai	1250	5.70	\$7,125
2025-10-01	Analysis	Legal research re what establishes "interstate commerce" for purposes of residual clause of FAA	Aashish Desai	1250	7.70	\$9,625
2025-09-25	Settlement	Mediation in Los Angeles with JAMS, Joel Grossman (mediator)	Aashish Desai	1250	13.70	\$17,125
2025-09-23	Settlement	Prepare for mediation	Aashish Desai	1250	5.00	\$6,250
2025-09-20	Analysis	Analysis of employment records from Carmona, Arriola, Diaz and others to determine Trip Sheet issues for minimum wage claims	Aashish Desai	1250	6.60	\$8,250
2025-09-18	Analysis	Analysis of Answer	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2025-09-18	Settlement	Prepare for mediation	Aashish Desai	1250	10.00	\$12,500
2025-09-16	Conference	Prepare for client call re mediation (2:42); participate in zoom call with clients (1:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	3.70	\$4,625
2025-09-13	Analysis	Continue crunching numbers for exposure model for mediation and settlement	Aashish Desai	1250	4.70	\$5,875
2025-09-11	Analysis	Analysis of wage claims, computations with raw data (5:00); Analysis of production of 25% sample for warehouse workers, meal/rest and 4/10 violations for OT claims (4:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	9.00	\$11,250
2025-07-29	Analysis	Analysis of Order granting request to further modify Scheduling Order	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2025-07-28	Analysis	Review Motion to Amend Scheduling Order due to clerical error	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2025-07-21	Analysis	Review Order granting amended scheduling order	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2025-07-18	Analysis	Review Joint Stipulation to Amend Scheduling Order to allow for Mediation	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2025-07-11	Analysis	Analysis of Order granting disclosure of putative class members	Aashish Desai	1250	1.40	\$1,750
2025-06-09	Pleadings	Review and authorize Joint Stipulation for disclosure of class member contact information	Aashish Desai	1250	2.10	\$2,625
2025-06-02	Pleadings	Review and authorize Stipulation for Protective Order	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-05-21	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's Answer	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2025-04-26	Phone Call	Prepare for and participate in zoom call with clients re update and status	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2025-04-21	Pleadings	Prepare and file First Amended Complaint	Aashish Desai	1250	4.60	\$5,750
2025-04-18	Analysis	Analysis of Order granting request to file amended complaint	Aashish Desai	1250	0.20	\$250
2025-04-17	Pleadings	Prepare review and file Joint Stipulation to file Amended Complaint	Aashish Desai	1250	2.20	\$2,750
2025-02-10	Analysis	Review, revise file Joint Stipulation for new briefing schedule for class certification	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2024-12-19	Analysis	Review amended order re scheduling dates by Court	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2024-12-03	Analysis	Analysis of Order re Rescheduling Dates	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2024-12-02	Pleadings	Review, revise and finalize Joint Rule 26(f) Report of Counsel	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2024-10-24	Analysis	Review, finalize and file Joint Stipulation to Continue Conference	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2024-10-24	Analysis	Review notice of appearance by normal leon, Joseph Piesco for Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2024-09-25	Analysis	Analysis of order setting Rule 26(f) conference	Aashish Desai	1250	1.82	\$2,271
2024-08-19	Pleadings	Review, finalize Consolidated Complaint	Aashish Desai	1250	6.60	\$8,250
2024-07-16	Pleading	Read, review and finalize consolidated complaint (combining Carmona with Arriola)	Aashish Desai	1250	4.00	\$5,000
2024-06-07	Analysis	Review notice of related cases filed by Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	1.30	\$1,625
2024-06-05	Conference	Prepare for and participate in conference call with all counsel re coordination of cases	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2024-05-22	Analysis	Continued analysis of wage claim after remand from Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	3.20	\$4,000
2024-05-20	Analysis	Analysis of merits issues on remand	Aashish Desai	1250	3.70	\$4,625
2024-05-16	Analysis	Analysis of status of case after SCOTUS denial of second writ	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2024-05-06	Phone Call	PC with drivers re status of action and next steps	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2024-04-22	Analysis	Analysis of Mandate from Ninth Circuit filed in district court	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2023-10-24	Analysis	Study petition for cert (second) to SCOTUS	Aashish Desai	1250	8.40	\$10,500
2023-10-23	Analysis	Read and analyze Domino's (second) Petition for Writ of Certiorari	Aashish Desai	1250	6.00	\$7,500
2023-10-19	Analysis	Analysis of SCOTUS denial for review	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2023-10-06	Analysis	Analysis of Ninth Circuit's opinion for app-based drivers and application of labor code; cf. Fifth, Second, Fourth Circuits	Aashish Desai	1250	7.35	\$9,188
2023-10-03	Analysis	Further analysis on interstate commerce issue and prior SCOTUS opinions on issue, potential conflict with Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	6.70	\$8,375
2023-09-20	Pleadings	Review stip re stay and continue def's response date	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2023-09-14	Pleadings	Prepare Acknowledgment of Receipt	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2023-09-14	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's arbitration agreement and FAA exclusion under residual clause of Section 1	Aashish Desai	1250	9.70	\$12,125
2023-09-05	Conference	Conference with Paralegal re documents from Domino's of Raul Quiroz	Aashish Desai	1250	2.35	\$2,938
2023-08-28	Pleadings	Prepare FAC Labor Code only	Aashish Desai	1250	5.70	\$7,125
2023-08-28	Review and Revise	Read, review and revise FAC	Aashish Desai	1250	2.75	\$3,438
2023-08-21	Correspondence	Finalize PAGA letter to LWDA	Aashish Desai	1250	6.60	\$8,250
2023-08-14	Analysis	Review finalize Retainer Agreements for Daniel Etchepare, Gyorgy Diaz	Aashish Desai	1250	1.20	\$1,500
2023-08-14	Analysis	Analyze order granting request to stay mandate	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2023-08-11	Conference	Conference with paralegal re Daniel Etchepare and related issues to adding class reps	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2023-08-10	Conference	Conference with paralegal re background employment facts from Gyorgy Diaz	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2023-08-10	Analysis	Analysis of motion to stay mandate	Aashish Desai	1250	6.00	\$7,500
2023-07-21	Analysis	Analysis of Order from Ninth Circuit, affirmed	Aashish Desai	1250	8.10	\$10,125
2023-07-20	Pleadings	Review and finalize Retainer Agreement for Tom Arriola	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2023-07-15	Analysis	Legal research re additional claims from Tom Arriola and effect on pending class action	Aashish Desai	1250	8.70	\$10,875
2023-06-27	Analysis	Study Domino's supplemental authorities after oral argument	Aashish Desai	1250	7.35	\$9,188
2023-06-27	Analysis	Analysis of email from associate re update on claims and factual issues with Tom's WC claims	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2023-06-20	Court	Prepare for and argue before Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	3.20	\$4,000
2023-06-19	Analysis	Travel to SF for oral argument and study materials along the way	Aashish Desai	1250	4.60	\$5,750
2023-06-08	Phone Call	PC with Tom Arriola re claims	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2023-05-26	Phone Call	PC with Tom Arriola re potential new claims against Domino's and legal representation	Aashish Desai	1250	1.40	\$1,750
2023-05-23	Pleadings	Analysis of acknowledgment of hearing notice by Domino's (1:00); Prepare same for plaintiffs/appellants (1:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2023-05-18	Analysis	Review notice of oral argument and orders thereto from Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	1.90	\$2,375
2023-02-22	Analysis	Study orders allowing briefs from amicus and Domino's, instructions for copies, etc.	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2023-02-15	Analysis	Study supplemental brief by Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	6.70	\$8,375
2023-02-09	Analysis	Analysis of appearance of Garson, Harry, Smoger for Dominos, study bios	Aashish Desai	1250	2.20	\$2,750
2023-02-03	Analysis	Review order granting motion for leave to file amicus brief by American Association for Justice	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2023-02-01	Analysis	Study brief by amicus curie American Association for Justice	Aashish Desai	1250	4.00	\$5,000
2023-01-31	Analysis	Analysis of order granting motion for leave to file brief by amicus	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2023-01-30	Analysis	Study brief of amicus curie Conditional Accountability Center	Aashish Desai	1250	9.70	\$12,125
2023-01-26	Pleadings	Study order filing supplement brief and instructions thereafter	Aashish Desai	1250	3.60	\$4,500
2023-01-25	Pleadings	Finalize and file supplemental brief to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	7.30	\$9,125
2023-01-23	Analysis	Preparing responsive appellate brief	Aashish Desai	1250	10.00	\$12,500
2023-01-20	Analysis	Study appearance of amicus curie Constitutional Accountability Center	Aashish Desai	1250	1.40	\$1,750
2023-01-20	Analysis	Further analysis of legal issues on appeal	Aashish Desai	1250	8.00	\$10,000
2023-01-10	Analysis	Analysis of issues to prepare opposition beef to Ninth	Aashish Desai	1250	7.60	\$9,500
2023-01-03	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's supplemental brief to Ninth	Aashish Desai	1250	9.00	\$11,250
2022-12-29	Analysis	Study of appearance from Jacob Frasch for Domino's, study bio	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2022-12-29	Analysis	Review notice of appearance of Courtney Saleski for Domino's, study bio	Aashish Desai	1250	1.80	\$2,250
2022-11-22	Analysis	Study order from Ninth Circuit setting another briefing schedule and argument after SCOTUS order	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2022-11-22	Analysis	Analysis of SCOTUS order granting certiorari, vacated the judgment, and remanded for further consideration in light of Saxon	Aashish Desai	1250	4.35	\$5,438

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2022-11-18	Analysis	Analysis of Order granting cert petition and remanding case to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	3.60	\$4,500
2022-10-18	Analysis	Review SCOTUS grant of certiorari	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2022-08-30	Filing/Coordination	Coordinate preparation of 40 copies of opposition papers to SCOTUS after review of rules	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2022-07-27	Analysis	Analysis of amicus brief ISO cert to US Supreme Court by Chamber of Commerce	Aashish Desai	1250	5.00	\$6,250
2022-07-18	Analysis	Analysis of Chamber of Commerce Brief in support of Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	6.70	\$8,375
2022-07-07	Analysis	Read email from Chamber of Commerce lawyer re intent to file amicus brief (0:21); Analysis of legal effect of amicus request and potential legal obstacles to same (4:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	4.35	\$5,438
2022-07-05	Analysis	Analysis of arguments against petition for cert to SCOTUS	Aashish Desai	1250	7.35	\$9,188
2022-07-01	Analysis	Study Domino's cert petition and opposition thereto	Aashish Desai	1250	10.60	\$13,250
2022-06-21	Analysis	Analysis of petition for cert filed to SCOTUS	Aashish Desai	1250	7.70	\$9,625
2022-05-22	Analysis	Analysis of Supreme Court Letter filed with Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2022-05-10	Analysis	Review letter from SCOTUS regarding application for an extension of time to file petition of writ of cert	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2022-02-22	Analysis	Review order granting motion to stay mandate	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2022-02-18	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's motion to extend time to file a motion to stay mandate until 2/25/2022	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2021-12-30	Analysis	Review request for more time to mention for rehearing by Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2021-12-23	Analysis	Analysis of Order from Ninth Circuit affirming district court	Aashish Desai	1250	5.00	\$6,250
2021-12-23	Analysis	Opinion from Ninth Circuit - affirmed order on arbitration	Aashish Desai	1250	5.00	\$6,250
2021-11-15	Court	Argue case to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2021-11-10	Court	Prepare for oral argument	Aashish Desai	1250	9.00	\$11,250
2021-11-02	Court	Prepare for oral argument	Aashish Desai	1250	10.00	\$12,500
2021-10-21	Analysis	Review email from Domino's counsel, NL, re remote oral argument info (0:21); Continue preparing for oral argument before Ninth Circuit (5:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	5.21	\$6,513
2021-09-20	Analysis	Review acknowledgment of oral argument from Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2021-09-10	Analysis	Study acknowledgment of hearing notice re argument time and sharing time	Aashish Desai	1250	0.90	\$1,125
2021-09-05	Analysis	Review notice and order of oral argument	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2021-08-24	Analysis	Analysis of 9th Cir files and deadlines thereto	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2021-07-26	Analysis	Study reply appellate brief	Aashish Desai	1250	10.00	\$12,500
2021-07-09	Analysis	Analysis of Ninth Circuit order setting argument date	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2021-06-23	Analysis	Review streamlined request for extension by Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	0.20	\$250
2021-06-09	Pleadings	Finalize and file Answering Brief	Aashish Desai	1250	6.00	\$7,500
2021-06-08	Pleadings	Prepare Answering Brief (continued)	Aashish Desai	1250	9.35	\$11,688
2021-06-06	Analysis	Continue preparing Answering Brief	Aashish Desai	1250	6.70	\$8,375
2021-06-01	Pleadings	Analysis of legal claims to prepare appellate response to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	10.00	\$12,500
2021-05-18	Analysis	Review orders receiving copies of brief and excerpts of records	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2021-05-10	Analysis	Analysis of clerk's order filing brief	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2021-05-10	Analysis	Analysis of Excerpts of Record designated by Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	4.70	\$5,875
2021-05-07	Analysis	Study operation brief from Dominos to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	9.00	\$11,250
2021-05-05	Analysis	Review notice of appearance of Norman Leon, study background of appellate work	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2021-05-03	Analysis	Study mediation order releasing case	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2021-04-01	Analysis	Review order granting extension with new briefing schedule	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2021-03-31	Analysis	Study Order staying case pending appeal	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2021-03-30	Analysis	Review Domino's unopposed request for extension	Aashish Desai	1250	0.20	\$250
2021-03-15	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's Reply to stay motion	Aashish Desai	1250	5.90	\$7,375
2021-03-04	Pleadings	Prepare and finalize Plaintiffs' Opposition to Stay request	Aashish Desai	1250	7.20	\$9,000
2021-03-02	Court	Participate in mediation conference	Aashish Desai	1250	1.20	\$1,500
2021-03-02	Conference	Conference with staff re opposition to motion to stay (assignments and evaluations)	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2021-03-01	Analysis	Analysis of legal issues to stay proceeding	Aashish Desai	1250	6.60	\$8,250
2021-02-26	Pleadings	Analysis of Domino's motion to stay case pending appeal to Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	5.70	\$7,125
2021-02-19	Analysis	Review order scheduling mediation	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2021-02-17	Analysis	Analysis of Order granting exertion	Aashish Desai	1250	0.20	\$250
2021-02-16	Analysis	Review streamlined request for extension to file brief	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2021-02-15	Analysis	Review order denying petition for rehearing en banc	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2021-01-25	Analysis	Analysis of order re mediation conference scheduled	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2021-01-25	Analysis	Review email from 9th circuit mediation re medication conference (0:12); Prepare for mediation by reviewing legal claims and impact of ruling globally (3:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	3.20	\$4,000
2021-01-20	Analysis	Study pension for panel rehearing and petition for review	Aashish Desai	1250	8.70	\$10,875
2021-01-13	Pleadings	Prepare and complete Mediation Questionnaire	Aashish Desai	1250	3.70	\$4,625
2021-01-06	Pleadings	Prepare file notice of appearance before Ninth Circuit	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2021-01-05	Analysis	Analysis of Notice of Appeal	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2021-01-04	Analysis	Analysis of Order re schooling dates and trial setting	Aashish Desai	1250	2.35	\$2,938
2021-01-03	Analysis	Review order granting 14 day extension	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2020-12-30	Pleadings	Work with defense counsel to prepare Joint Rule 26 Report (3:00), file with court (0:36)	Aashish Desai	1250	3.60	\$4,500
2020-12-09	Analysis	Review Order denying motion to compel	Aashish Desai	1250	3.90	\$4,875
2020-12-02	Conference	Exchange emails with Law360 re order denying MTC (0:24); PC with reporter from Law360 re same (0:24)	Aashish Desai	1250	0.80	\$1,000
2020-11-23	Analysis	Study Domino's Reply brief to compel arbitration	Aashish Desai	1250	7.60	\$9,500
2020-11-23	Analysis	Review Court's Order granting stipulation to continue Rule 26 hearing	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2020-11-20	Analysis	Study and review stipulation to continue Rule 26 conference and all related dates pending decision on arbitration issue	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2020-11-16	Analysis	Review emails from Domino's counsel, Steve Hernandez re moving scheduling conference and motion to compel arbitration (0:36); Analysis of potential arguments for motion to compel arb (2:00)	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2020-11-12	Pleadings	Finalize and file opposition to MCA	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2020-11-12	Pleadings	Prepare opposition to Domino's motion to compel arbitration	Aashish Desai	1250	8.60	\$10,750
2020-11-11	Research	Legal Research re enforcement of arbitration and the Section exemption under FAA for transportation workers	Aashish Desai	1250	9.20	\$11,500
2020-11-09	Analysis	Study Domino's motion to compel arbitration	Aashish Desai	1250	5.70	\$7,125
2020-10-09	Analysis	Study Order Setting Rule 26(f) Conference and related deadlines	Aashish Desai	1250	1.90	\$2,375
2020-10-07	Analysis	Study Order re Transfers o Judge Selna	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-10-06	Pleadings	Review Stipulation to Extend time to respond to complaint	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2020-10-05	Analysis	Review Notice of Deficiencies from removal and notice thereto	Aashish Desai	1250	0.90	\$1,125
2020-10-05	Analysis	Study Notice of Assignment to Judge Carter. ie., review prior decisions critical to current case issues	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2020-10-02	Analysis	Review Notice and Acknowledgment of Service	Aashish Desai	1250	0.00	\$0
2020-10-01	Analysis	Study Notice of Related Case and effect on litigation	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2020-10-01	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's Notice of Interested Parties	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2020-10-01	Analysis	Review Domino's Corporate Disclosure Statement	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-10-01	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's removal to federal court and evaluate basis for remand	Aashish Desai	1250	3.60	\$4,500
2020-09-01	Pleadings	Review revise and finalize Joint Status Conference Statement	Aashish Desai	1250	2.60	\$3,250
2020-09-01	Pleadings	Finalize and file FAC	Aashish Desai	1250	3.00	\$3,750
2020-08-28	Pleadings	Prepare (review, revise and finalize) FAC state court 2802	Aashish Desai	1250	6.40	\$8,000
2020-08-28	Correspondence	Prepare letter to defense re 2802 claims	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2020-08-12	Correspondence	Exchange emails with Domino's counsel, TW, re response to complaint and extension	Aashish Desai	1250	0.35	\$438
2020-08-10	Analysis	Analysis of minute order re status conference and other issues	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2020-07-24	Pleadings	Review stip to continue trial date	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250
2020-07-22	Pleading	Review and approve of stipulation to continue trial	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-07-13	Analysis	Analysis of Def's supplemental brief on MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2020-06-29	Correspondence	Review correspondence and documents re accepting service of complaint in lieu of process	Aashish Desai	1250	1.90	\$2,375
2020-06-26	Pleadings	Finalize and file state court Class Action Complaint at OCSC, Complex	Aashish Desai	1250	5.20	\$6,500
2020-06-25	Conference	Conference with paralegal re retaining Abraham Mendoza and facts surrounding employment	Aashish Desai	1250	1.70	\$2,125
2020-06-24	Analysis	Analysis of potential PAGA penalties (unpaid wages, wage statements)	Aashish Desai	1250	5.20	\$6,500
2020-06-22	Analysis	Additional review of all MSJ papers	Aashish Desai	1250	4.20	\$5,250
2020-06-20	Pleadings	Review revise draft state court Class Complaint against Domino's for wage violations	Aashish Desai	1250	6.90	\$8,625
2020-06-19	Trial	Trial preparation	Aashish Desai	1250	6.70	\$8,375
2020-06-19	Conference	Prepare for and participate in conference of counsel re pre-trial deadlines	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-06-19	Conference	Conference with staff re pre-trial documents	Aashish Desai	1250	1.00	\$1,250

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2020-06-19	Analysis	Analysis of Court's order on ex parte to continue trial	Aashish Desai	1250	0.20	\$250
2020-06-18	Analysis	Analysis of Def's ex parte to continue trial	Aashish Desai	1250	2.00	\$2,500
2020-06-18	Conference	Conference with associate re response to ex parte	Aashish Desai	1250	0.70	\$875
2020-06-18	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's argument re fabrication of time records and impact on wage claims	Aashish Desai	1250	4.35	\$5,438
2020-06-18	Pleading	Review and finalize Plaintiff's opposition to ex parte	Aashish Desai	1250	2.70	\$3,375
2020-06-18	Trial	Trial preparation	Aashish Desai	1250	6.00	\$7,500
2020-06-17	Analysis	Review and finalize Retainer for Roger Nogueira	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-06-17	Analysis	Analysis of Def's Opp to Ptf's MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	5.70	\$7,125
2020-06-17	Pleading	Prepare Plaintiff's Reply to MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	9.00	\$11,250
2020-06-17	Phone Call	Conference call of counsel re trial	Aashish Desai	1250	0.60	\$750
2020-06-16	Analysis	Analysis of Def's MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	7.00	\$8,750
2020-06-16	Pleading	Prepare outline for opposition to Def's MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	3.20	\$4,000
2020-06-16	Correspondence	Numerous emails re assignments for opposition to MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	1.20	\$1,500
2020-06-15	Pleadings	Review, revise and finalize Retainer agreement for E. Carmona	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2020-06-15	Analysis	Further analysis of Def's MSJ	Aashish Desai	1250	2.35	\$2,938
2020-06-13	Analysis	Analysis of effect of Silva appeal and using evidence on FAA arbitration argument for underlying claims and anticipated FRCP 12(b)(6) from Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	7.70	\$9,625
2020-06-05	Analysis	Analysis of potential wage claims against Domino's, including pay plan violations under 226.2, wage statement issues, meal/rest break, and PAGA issues	Aashish Desai	1250	8.20	\$10,250
2020-06-02	Phone Call	Phone calls w Edmond, Abraham and Roger re legal claims against Domino's	Aashish Desai	1250	1.60	\$2,000
2025-10-21	Pleading	prepare PAGA letter and second amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2025-10-21	Phone Call	phone call with defense counsel re long form settlement and other correspondence	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2025-10-20	Pleadings	prepare and edit enhancement decl	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.98	\$933
2025-10-13	Settlement	draft settlement approval papers	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.95	\$1,855
2025-10-10	Settlement	draft motion for prelim approval; draft motion for attorneys fees and accompanying papers	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.13	\$2,969
2025-10-09	Settlement	draft motion for prelim approval and attorneys fees motion	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-10-01	Settlement	draft preliminary approval papers	Adrienne De Castro	950	4.02	\$3,815
2025-09-30	Settlement	prepare preliminary approval papers	Adrienne De Castro	950	5.71	\$5,424
2025-09-29	Settlement	prepare motion for prelim approval	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.45	\$3,276
2025-09-26	Correspondence	draft PAGA letter	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2025-09-25	Prepare	travel to LA for mediation	Adrienne De Castro	950	4.00	\$3,800
2025-09-25	Settlement	settlement mediation	Adrienne De Castro	950	9.00	\$8,550
2025-09-22	Settlement	prepare and update MOU; review data regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.94	\$892
2025-09-17	Correspondence	review and finalize damages matrix for mediation brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2025-09-02	Settlement	prepare damage matrix and second amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.03	\$2,874
2025-08-27	Analysis	review discovery to determine class data ifo	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-08-27	Correspondence	confer with AYD re data we need for mediation; send email to defense counsel regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-07-22	Pleadings	draft motion to correct scheduling order	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-07-19	Pleadings	draft second amended consolidated complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-07-18	Pleadings	draft second amended consolidated complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2025-07-17	Pleadings	draft amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2025-07-17	Pleadings	prepare joint stip and finalize changes	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2025-07-16	Pleadings	draft stip to amend scheduling order and class cert briefing; confer with AYD regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-07-08	Discovery	prepare notes and prep re bel-aire west calls	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2025-07-02	Discovery	index discovery production	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.70	\$664

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-07-01	Discovery	review and analyze discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	4.00	\$3,800
2025-06-25	Discovery	review and index document production	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2025-06-10	Discovery	finalize discovery responses	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-06-09	Discovery	draft responses and review client docs	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.34	\$1,268
2025-06-06	Discovery	draft responses to RFPs	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-06-05	Discovery	draft responses to RFPs	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.85	\$1,756
2025-06-04	Discovery	prepare responses to discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-05-30	Discovery	draft responses to discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-05-21	Discovery	prepare responses to discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,896
2025-05-20	Discovery	draft domino's deposition notices and review disclosures re witnesses	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-05-19	Discovery	draft discovery responses	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.99	\$942
2025-05-19	Pleadings	review protective order and bel-aire west notice	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-05-14	Phone Call	call with client regarding depositions	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2025-05-13	Discovery	prepare responses to discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2025-05-07	Discovery	prepare and update client discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.03	\$1,931
2025-04-30	Discovery	draft responses to rogs; and review Zoom meeting with clients	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.19	\$3,031
2025-04-29	Analysis	prepare discovery responses	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-04-26	Meetings	call with clients to obtain info re discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-04-22	Discovery	review and prepare responses	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-04-07	Pleadings	prepare stipulation to file amended complaint; correspondence with defense counsel regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-03-21	Phone Call	phone call with opposing counsel	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2025-03-11	Discovery	prepare and respond to discovery production re protective order and bel-aire west notice ; confer with AYD regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.20	\$1,140
2025-03-06	Pleadings	draft amended complaint; and send to defense counsel re same	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.65	\$618
2025-03-05	Pleadings	draft amended complaint; review client memo	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-03-04	Pleadings	draft amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2025-02-04	Pleadings	draft stip and proposed order re class cert briefing	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2025-01-04	Discovery	draft discovery	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2024-12-19	Correspondence	review court scheduling order and email defense counsel re class cert regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2024-11-04	Discovery	draft initial disclosures and finalize	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2024-10-28	Discovery	draft 30b6 depo notice	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2024-10-23	Review and Revise	review and approve stip re status conf	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2024-10-16	Discovery	draft initial disclosures	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.02	\$968
2024-10-02	Phone Call	Rule 26 meeting with defense counsel.	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.48	\$453
2024-08-08	Pleadings	review and followup re consolidated complaint; draft joint stip and order re sae	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2024-07-29	Pleadings	call with defense counsel re consolidated complaint; confer with AYD regarding same; and update complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2024-07-16	Pleadings	updated consolidated complaint and correspond with AYD and client regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2024-07-03	Pleadings	prepare consolidated complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.13	\$1,078

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2024-07-03	Phone Call	phone call with defense counsel re satus report	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.25	\$238
2024-07-03	Pleadings	draft joint status report	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.66	\$628
2024-07-01	Pleadings	draft consolidated complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.36	\$2,245
2024-06-05	Phone Call	call with defense counsel to coordinae joint report and consolidating cases	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2023-11-13	Phone Call	phone call with public citizen re supreme court help	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.70	\$665
2023-11-13	Correspondence	prepare and edit letter requesting extension to file response to writ of cert	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-10-23	Analysis	review cert petition	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-10-23	Pleadings	draft procedural history regarding appeals	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2023-09-19	Review and Revise	draft second amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.18	\$1,125
2023-08-21	Pleading	review and prepare first amended complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2023-08-14	Pleadings	prepare first amended complaint; review and analyze client intake notes	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.06	\$1,006
2023-07-27	Pleadings	draft arriola labor code complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-07-19	Analysis	review Tom Arriola's documents	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-07-17	Analysis	review and analyze Tom's paystubs, and notes	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-07-10	Pleading	prepare status of filings	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.28	\$270
2023-06-27	Correspondence	draft PAGA letter	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.03	\$2,878
2023-06-27	Phone Call	phone call with Tom Arriola re potential claims	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-06-12	Correspondence	prepare domino's PAGA letter	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2023-06-08	Analysis	shepardize saxon and analyze, research cases to prepare memo for AYD re 9th circuit argument	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2023-06-07	Analysis	shepardize carmona and analyze cases to prepare memo for AYD	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.22	\$1,156
2023-05-31	Analysis	prepare new PAGA letter re Arriola	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2023-05-30	Correspondence	prepare PAGA letter	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.21	\$1,152
2023-01-25	Pleadings	review draft and edit response supplemental brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2023-01-24	Analysis	draft supplement brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.50	\$2,375
2023-01-10	Prepare	prep outline for response to supplemental brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2023-01-10	Analysis	call with potential amicus and prep for call	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.71	\$676
2023-01-09	Analysis	review and analyze supplemental brief to prepare for amicus brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.30	\$1,236
2022-11-08	Research	review and analyze Domino's 10K and 10Q filings	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.40	\$1,334
2022-08-30	Analysis	review scotus filing re opp to petition for writ	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2021-09-23	Pleadings	draft reply brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2021-09-21	Pleadings	draft appellate reply brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.90	\$3,702
2021-09-20	Pleadings	draft reply brief in domino's	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.34	\$3,176
2021-05-17	Pleadings	draft opening brief for appeal	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.97	\$3,770
2021-05-13	Pleadings	draft opening appellate brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	4.32	\$4,101
2021-05-11	Review	Read and review AYD's outline re appellate argument	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.89	\$844
2021-05-05	Pleadings	draft appellate opening brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.00	\$1,900
2021-05-04	Pleadings	draft appellate brief	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2021-04-22	Analysis	review court order and prepare outline for appeal	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2021-02-09	Pleadings	prepare mediation questionnaire for appeal	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2020-07-07	Pleading	draft paystub portion of objection and request for oral argument, re tentative ruling	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2020-06-24	Pleadings	draft state court complaint	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.52	\$1,443
2020-06-17	Pleading	draft opposition to motion in limine and conduct research regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	2.02	\$1,916
2020-06-17	Phone Call	call with defense counsel and AYD regarding potential trial continuance	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2020-06-17	Pleadings	draft memorandum of contentions of law and fact	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2020-06-17	Pleadings	review and edit joint stipulation to continue trial	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.50	\$475
2020-06-17	Pleadings	draft opp to ex parte motion to continue trial; research and analysis regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	3.00	\$2,850
2020-06-16	Pleadings	review opposition to MSJ; draft and research reply to brief.	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.83	\$1,742
2020-06-16	Pleadings	review opposition to MSJ; draft and research reply to brief.	Adrienne De Castro	950	4.25	\$4,038
2020-06-16	Pleadings	draft response to evidentiary objections	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.00	\$950
2020-06-16	Pleadings	draft opposition to Motion in Limine re barring use of representative testimony; research and analysis regarding same	Adrienne De Castro	950	1.50	\$1,425
2020-06-15	Pleadings	prepare motion in limine	Adrienne De Castro	950	0.80	\$760
2025-11-19	Settlement	Insert and re-calculate Billing lodestar for Motion of Attorneys' Fees	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2025-11-18	Settlement	Revising of settlement agreement to reflect defense counsel's edits and formatting issues	Sonia Nava	290	1.90	\$551
2025-11-18	Correspondence	Email to defense counsel re executed settlement agreement	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2025-11-17	Settlement	Finalize calculations for Costs worksheet	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2025-11-14	Pleading	Motion for Prelim, Motion for Attny's fees - finalizing, formatting, TOA-TOC	Sonia Nava	290	4.00	\$1,160
2025-11-14	Correspondence	Communication with Tom re settlement agreement	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-11-13	Pleading	Formatting, TOA/TOC of Motion for Prelim and Attnys Fees	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-11-13	Phone Call	Phone calls with clients re settlemnt agreement long-form	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2025-11-13	Coordinate	Coordinating emailing re settlement agreement long-form with clients	Sonia Nava	290	1.90	\$551
2025-11-13	Settlement	Work on firm Costs legal services and fees	Sonia Nava	290	2.50	\$725
2025-11-12	Phone Call	Phone calls with clients re settlemnt agreement long-form	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2025-11-12	Coordinate	Coordinating of clients signatures for Settlement agreement Long-form	Sonia Nava	290	3.50	\$1,015
2025-11-10	Settlement	Pull invoices and calculations for Costs all cases Silva, Arriola and Carmona	Sonia Nava	290	4.00	\$1,160
2025-11-04	Coordinate	Coordination of Docusign re updated service award Dec for Abraham	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2025-11-04	Correspondence	Email exchange w/ Abraham re questions on Dec	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2025-11-03	Coordinate	Coordination of Docusign re updated service award Dec for Arriola	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2025-11-03	Phone Call	P/C with Tom re updated Dec	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2025-11-03	Pleading	Updated service award Dec of Arriola	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2025-10-29	Phone Call	P/C w/ Abraham and Roger	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2025-10-29	Pleadings	Finalizing of remaining service award Decs	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-10-28	Coordinate	Coordinating of Docusign service award Decs for Tom, Daniel, and Gyorgy	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2025-10-28	Pleading	Finalizing of Tom, Daniel and Diaz's service award Decs	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-10-21	Correspondence	Emails to clients re service award declarations	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2025-10-20	Phone Call	P/C with Edmond re declaration	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2025-10-15	Pleadings	Drafting of settlement award Decs	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2025-10-15	Phone Call	P/C w/ clients re settlement award Decs	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-10-15	Pleading	Drafting of settlement award Decs	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2025-10-14	Settlement	Spreadsheet for billing updated for adding up total time for Attorneys fees	Sonia Nava	290	5.00	\$1,450
2025-10-12	Settlement	Report for Billing in both Carmona and Arriola cases for Attorneys Fees	Sonia Nava	290	4.00	\$1,160
2025-10-07	Correspondence	Correspondence with clients regarding statements and update	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-10-06	Phone Call	Phone calls with clients re declarations	Sonia Nava	290	5.00	\$1,450

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2025-09-25	Settlement	Mediation in Los Angeles with JAMS, Joel Grossman (mediator)	Sonia Nava	290	10.00	\$2,900
2025-09-19	Conference	Zoom call w/ clients re mediation	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2025-09-15	Coordinate	Coordinating of clients attendance at mediation	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2025-09-10	Coordinate	Coordination of client zoom meeting	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2025-07-21	Coordinate	Filing of Notice of acknowledgment of receipt and POS	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2025-07-02	Correspondence	Correspondence with Norman Leon re acceptance of service	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2023-09-20	Pleadings	Joint Stip re Stay & continued defs response date (Arriola)	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2023-09-14	Correspondence	Prepare opt-out notice for Tom Arriola	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2023-09-14	Analysis	Analysis of Dominos Acknowledgment of Arb agreement	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2023-09-14	Phone Call	P/C w/ Tom Arriola re Arb agreement and opt-out notice	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2023-09-14	Analysis	Analysis of communications re Arb agreement and Opt-out notice	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2023-08-23	Analysis	Analysis of Raul Quiroz documents from Domino's	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2023-08-28	Pleadings	Finalize FAC Labor Code only	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2023-08-21	Coordinate	Prepare and submit amended PAGA Notice to LWDA	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2023-08-21	Pleadings	Pleading preparation of FAC in Arriola	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2023-08-14	Coordinate	Coordination Docusign retainer agreement to Daniel Etchepare	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2023-08-11	Phone Call	P/C w/ potential Daniel Etchepare	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2023-08-10	Phone Call	P/C w/ potential Gyorgy Diaz	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2023-08-10	Phone Call	P/C with Tom re information on case	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2023-07-20	Coordinate	Retainer agreement for Tom Arriola	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2023-05-26	Phone Call	Client Intake - potential Tom Arriola P/C	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2020-11-23	Analysis	Order granting Joint Stip to Cont Rile 26f Scheduling Conference	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2020-11-23	Analysis	Analysis of Def's Reply ISO MTC Arb	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2020-12-09	Analysis	Analysis & calendaring of Minute Order re Defs MTC Arb	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2020-12-30	Filing/Coordination	Finalizing & Filing of Joint Rule 26 Report of Counsel	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2021-01-04	Admin	Analysis & Calendaring Minutes in Chambers Order re Scheduling Dates by Selna	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2021-01-05	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's Ntc of Appeal in Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-01-06	Analysis	Analysis and Calendaring of Ninth Cir's schedule	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2021-01-07	Correspondence	Correspondence with Abraham Mendoza re case updates	Sonia Nava	290	0.45	\$131
2021-01-13	Filing/Coordination	Mediation Questionnaire submitted Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2021-02-03	Discovery	Finalize Plts' Discovery Requests RFP, Rogs and 30(b)6 Depo	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2021-02-03	Phone Call	P/C w/ clients re Discovery	Sonia Nava	290	1.20	\$348
2021-02-03	Correspondence	Email exchange with clients re Discovery	Sonia Nava	290	1.25	\$363
2021-02-18	Discovery	Plts Discovery Requests RFP & Rogs and Ntc of Taking 30(b)6 Deposition	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2021-02-19	Admin	Analysis and calendaring of court's notice re Mediation conf scheduled	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-03-04	Filing/Coordination	Finalizing and filing of Ntc and Mtn to Stay case pending Appeal Carmona	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2021-03-15	Analysis	Analysis of Reply ISO Mtn to Stay case pending appeal	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-03-22	Analysis	Analysis of Def's service of Discovery objections	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-03-25	Analysis	Analysis of court's tentative ruling on granting Mtn to Stay	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2021-03-30	Analysis	Dominos filing of motion to extend time to file their opening brief	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-03-31	Analysis	Minutes order re Defs Mtn to Stay Judge Selna	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2021-04-21	Correspondence	Correspondence to Edmond, Roger and Abraham re status of case	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2021-04-21	Analysis	Analysis filed clerk order of Appellants unopposed motion for extension of time to file opening brief granted; calendar all new dates	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2021-05-03	Analysis	Court notice of release from mediation program in carmona	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-05-06	Analysis	Notice of added attorney Norman Leon in Dominos ninth cir carmona	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-05-10	Coordinate	Email from clerk confirming opening brief rcvd electronically order to file paper copies	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2021-05-18	Analysis	Analysis of court email confirming submitted opening brief paper copies in Carmona	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-05-25	Review and Revise	Reviewing of draft answering brief in Carmona appeal from ADC	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2021-06-04	Correspondence	Correspondence from Steve Hernandez (Dominos) Excerpts of records download (Carmona)	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$216

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2021-06-04	Filing/Coordination	Finalizing and Filing of Answering brief to Ninth Cir (Carmona)	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2021-06-07	Analysis	Analysis court conformed and order to submit paper copies w/in 7 days (calendared) re filed electronic answering brief with Ninth Cir (Carmona)	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-06-08	Coordinate	Correspondence and coordination with Caleb re paper copies for answering brief in ninth cir	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2021-06-09	Filing/Coordination	Answer brief – filed paper copies to Ninth Cir.	Sonia Nava	290	0.70	\$203
2021-07-12	Analysis	Analysis and calendaring of Ninth Cir Response to Case Being Considered for oral Argument Carmona	Sonia Nava	290	0.45	\$131
2021-07-26	Analysis	Analysis Def's Reply brief Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2021-09-05	Analysis	Analysis & calendaring of Oral Argument schedule in Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2021-09-10	Filing/Coordination	Filing of Acknowledgment of hearing notice ninth cir	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2021-10-01	Analysis	Notice of Oral argument	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2021-12-27	Analysis	Opinion from Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2022-09-08	Coordinate	Coordination with Counsel Press re Response to Domino's Pet for a Writ of Cert	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2022-11-22	Coordinate	Calendaring of order from Supreme Court re filing of Supplemental Briefs	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2023-01-03	Analysis	Analysis of Domino's filed Supplemental Brief Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2023-01-25	Pleading	Finalizing & filing of Suppl brief for review in Ninth Cir	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2023-01-26	Coordinate	Coordination of suppl brief hard copies deliver to court	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2023-05-18	Phone Call	P/C w/ clients re update on case	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2023-05-18	Filing/Coordination	Calendaring of Notice of Oral Arg in Ninth Cir calendar filing of Acknowledgment of Hearing Notice	Sonia Nava	290	0.55	\$160
2023-05-23	Filing/Coordination	Coordination and filing of Acknowledgment of hearing notice Seattle oral argument	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2020-11-12	Pleadings	Finalizing & filing of Opp to MTC Arb	Sonia Nava	290	2.00	\$580
2020-11-10	Pleadings	Prepare Opp to MTC Arb	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2020-11-09	Coordinate	Calendaring of Defs MTC Arb	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2020-10-16	Analysis	Analysis & calendaring schedulling order from Selna	Sonia Nava	290	0.45	\$131
2020-10-07	Analysis	Analysis of Order re transfer from Carter to Selna	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2020-10-05	Analysis	Analysis of Notice of Assignment to Judge Carter in USDC Central	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2020-09-01	Pleadings	Prepare fior filing of Status conference statement	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218

Date	Service	Note	Team Member	Rate	Hours	TOTAL
2020-09-01	Phone Call	P/C w/ clients re update on status and next steps	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2020-09-01	Pleadings	Finalize & file Amended Complaint state court 2802	Sonia Nava	290	3.00	\$870
2020-08-28	Analysis	Analysis of correspondence w/ defense counsel re 2802 claims	Sonia Nava	290	0.20	\$58
2020-08-10	Analysis	Analysis & Calendaring - Minute Order re Status Conference	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2020-07-20	Filing/Coordination	Filing of Ntc of Acknowledgment and Proof of Service (state case)	Sonia Nava	290	1.50	\$435
2020-06-29	Correspondence	Correspondence to Defense Counsel; Courtesy copy of Complaint, Summons, and Notice and Acknowledgement	Sonia Nava	290	0.60	\$174
2020-06-29	Phone Call	P/C w/ clients re update on court filing and next steps	Sonia Nava	290	1.00	\$290
2020-06-26	Analysis	Analysis; Received conformed copies from Court 2:57pm	Sonia Nava	290	0.25	\$73
2020-06-25	Filing/Coordination	Filing of Complaint and initiating documents; Civil case coversheet and summons 11:53 am	Sonia Nava	290	4.00	\$1,160
2020-06-25	Coordinate	DocuSign retainer rcvd from Abraham Mendoza	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2020-06-25	Phone Call	P/C with Abraham Mendoza	Sonia Nava	290	0.50	\$145
2020-06-25	Pleadings	Finalize Complaint and initiating documents	Sonia Nava	290	2.50	\$725
2020-06-15	Coordinate	Retainer agreement for Roger Noguiera	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2020-06-15	Coordinate	Retainer agreement for Edmond Carmona	Sonia Nava	290	0.30	\$87
2020-06-02	Correspondence	Communication (email) with new clients Carmona, Abraham and Roger re intake and client documents	Sonia Nava	290	0.75	\$218
2020-06-02	Phone Call	Phone calls with new plaintiffs Edmond Carmona, Abraham and Roger	Sonia Nava	290	1.25	\$363
TOTAL				TOTAL	1058.71	\$1,121,883